

NEW MADISON PUBLIC LIBRARY
Roof Replacement
Bid Breakdown

Bid Date: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 @ 1:00 P.M.

Engineer's Estimate -- Base Bid - \$65,000.00

Description	Quantity	Fleagles Home Improvement			Enterprise Roofing & Sheet Metal			Sherriff-Goslin Roofing		
		Material Price	Labor Price	Total Price	Material Price	Labor Price	Total Price	Material Price	Labor Price	Total Price
Base Bid - Asphalt Shingles										
Roof Replacement - Asphalt Shingles	1 Lump	12,405.35	20,174.72	32,580.07	12,000.00	22,045.00	34,045.00	36,528.00	18,261.00	54,789.00
Skylight Replacement - 6 Units	6 Units	3,636.00	1,200.00	4,836.00	4,000.00	4,000.00	8,000.00	5,229.00	2,100.00	7,329.00
Deck Repairs	320 SF	259.60	500.00	759.60	160.00	160.00	320.00	320.00	400.00	720.00
Downspout Replacement	2 Each	200.00	300.00	500.00	500.00	1,500.00	2,000.00	220.00	525.00	745.00
Total Base Bid:				\$38,675.67		\$44,365.00		\$63,583.00		

Alternate #1 - Roof Replacement with Decra Stone Coatd Metal Roof Shingles

Roof Replacement - Decra Metal Shingle	1 Lump				30,500.00	28,105.00	58,605.00			
Skylight Replacement - 6 Units	6 Units				4,000.00	4,000.00	8,000.00			
Deck Repairs	320 SF				160.00	160.00	320.00			
Downspout Replacement	2 Each				500.00	1,500.00	2,000.00			
Total Alternate Bid #1:				NO BID		\$68,925.00		NO BID		

Alternate #2 - Roof Replacement with Stone Coated Steel or Metal Shingles

Roof Replacement - Metal or Steel Shingl	1 Lump				35,500.00	27,834.00	63,334.00			
Skylight Replacement - 6 Units	6 Units				4,000.00	4,000.00	8,000.00			
Deck Repairs	320 SF				160.00	160.00	320.00			
Downspout Replacement	2 Each				500.00	1,500.00	2,000.00			
Total Alternate Bid #2:				NO BID		\$73,654.00		NO BID		

Alternate #3 - Roof Replacement Voluntary Alternate

Roof Replacement - Voluntary Alternate	1 Lump				30,500.00	21,425.00	51,925.00			
Skylight Replacement - 6 Units	6 Units				4,000.00	4,000.00	8,000.00			
Deck Repairs	320 SF				0.00	0.00	No Tear-off			
Downspout Replacement	2 Each				500.00	1,500.00	2,000.00			
Total Alternate Bid #3:				NO BID		\$61,925.00		NO BID		