

Bid Breakdown
Water Treatment Plant Shop & Lime Sludge Dewatering Building
Village of West Mansfield

Gray shading indicates that the contractor intended to not submit a bid for the shaded item but mistakenly filled out the bid form incorrectly.

Engineer's Estimate, General Construction Bid: \$290,000.00

Engineer's Estimate, Electrical Construction Bid: \$21,000.00

Bid Item	Bid Item Description	Qty.	Unit	Detrick Enterprises, Inc. (Double D)		Muhlenkamp Building Corp.		Thomas & Marker Construction Co.		Doll Layman, Ltd.		Buschur Electric, Inc.	
				Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost
General Construction Bid - Lump Sum													
1	General Construction Bid	1	Lump	\$ 312,189.00	\$ 312,189.00	\$ 292,899.00	\$ 292,899.00	\$ 320,000.00	\$ 320,000.00	\$ 470,000.00	\$ 470,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Electrical Construction Bid - Lump Sum													
1	Electrical Construction Bid	1	Lump	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20,500.00	\$ 20,500.00
Combination General & Electrical Construction Bid - Lump Sum													
1	Combination General & Electrical Construction Bid	1	Lump	\$ 312,189.00	\$ 312,189.00	\$ 315,972.00	\$ 315,972.00	\$ 334,400.00	\$ 334,400.00	\$ 500,000.00	\$ 500,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
General Construction Bids with Low Electrical Construction Bid													
1	General Construction Bid	1	Lump	\$ 312,189.00	\$ 312,189.00	\$ 292,899.00	\$ 292,899.00	\$ 320,000.00	\$ 320,000.00	\$ 470,000.00	\$ 470,000.00	N/A	N/A
2	Low Electrical Construction Bid (Buschur Electric, Inc.)	1	Lump	\$ 20,500.00	\$ 20,500.00	\$ 20,500.00	\$ 20,500.00	\$ 20,500.00	\$ 20,500.00	\$ 20,500.00	\$ 20,500.00	N/A	N/A
Total				\$ 332,689.00		\$ 313,399.00		\$ 340,500.00		\$ 490,500.00		N/A	