
    Bid Date: Tuesday,  October 4, 2022 @ 10:00 AM

Item Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Base Bid Items (Completion Date 10-31-22)
253 Pavement Base Replacement, As Per Plan 50 S.Y.
407 Non-Tracking Tack Coat 1,464 Gal.
441 Asphalt Concrete Surface, Type 1 (448) PG64-22 717 C.Y. NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED
614 Maintaining Traffic, As Per Plan 1 Lump
624 Mobilization 1 Lump

Spec. Manhole Adjusted to Grade 2 Each
Spec. Water Valve Adjusted to Grade 9 Each

Total Base Bid 0.00 0.00

Alternate Bid #1 (Completion Date 10-31-22)
407 Non-Tracking Tack Coat 352 Gal.
441 Asphalt Concrete Surface, Type 1 (448) PG64-22 172 C.Y. NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED
614 Maintaining Traffic, As Per Plan 1 Lump

Spec. Water Valve Adjusted to Grade 1 Lump

Total Alternate Bid #1 0.00 0.00

Alternate Bid #2 (Completion Date 06-30-23)
253 Pavement Base Replacement, As Per Plan 50 S.Y. 175.00 8,750.00 145.00 7,250.00
407 Non-Tracking Tack Coat 1,464 Gal. 5.15 7,539.60 2.95 4,318.80
441 Asphalt Concrete Surface, Type 1 (448) PG64-22 717 C.Y. 256.00 183,552.00 269.00 192,873.00
614 Maintaining Traffic, As Per Plan 1 Lump 1,500.00 1,500.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
624 Mobilization 1 Lump 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,500.00 2,500.00

Spec. Manhole Adjusted to Grade 2 Each 750.00 1,500.00 975.00 1,950.00
Spec. Water Valve Adjusted to Grade 9 Each 125.00 1,125.00 125.00 1,125.00

Total Alternate Bid #2 205,966.60 215,016.80

Alternate Bid #3 (Completion Date 06-30-22)
407 Non-Tracking Tack Coat 352 Gal. 5.15 1,812.80 2.95 1,038.40
441 Asphalt Concrete Surface, Type 1 (448) PG64-22 172 C.Y. 264.00 45,408.00 269.00 46,268.00
614 Maintaining Traffic, As Per Plan 1 Lump 1,500.00 1,500.00 1,000.00 1,000.00

Spec. Water Valve Adjusted to Grade 1 Lump 125.00 125.00 125.00 125.00

Total Alternate Bid #3 48,845.80 48,431.40

VILLAGE OF OHIO CITY
Street Resurfacing 2022

Bid Breakdown

Quantity

Buehler Asphalt Paving, Inc. The Shelly Company


