VILLAGE OF POTSDAM, MIAMI COUNTY, OHIO
West Cross Street Sidewalk Improvements

Bid Date: Thursday August 1, 2024 @ 1:35 PM
Engineer's Estimate: $ 109,000 - Base Bid

Item

Base Bid
202
608
608
614
624
659

Item
Alt Bid #1

202
608
608
614
624
659

Description

Walk Removed

Concrete Walk, As Per Plan
8" Thick Concrete Walk
Maintaining Traffic
Mobilization

Seeding and Mulching, As Per Plan

Description

Walk Removed

Concrete Walk, As Per Plan
8" Thick Concrete Walk
Maintaining Traffic
Mobilization

Total Base Bid

Seeding and Mulching, As Per Plan

Total Alternate Bid #1

Quantity

6,946
6,214
732

1

1

990

S.F.
S.F.
S.F.
Lump
Lump
SY.

Quantity

6,946
6,214
732

1

1

990

S.F.
S.F.
S.F.
Lump
Lump
S.Y.

Bid Breakdown

Performance Site Development

Outdoor Enterprise, LLC

Finfrock Construction Company

Total Unit
Unit Price Price

1.25 8,682.50
7.25 45,051.50
10.00 7,320.00
2,950.00 2,950.00
1,950.00 1,950.00
5.00 4,950.00

Total Unit
$70,904.00

Performance Site Development

Total Unit
Unit Price Price

2.00 13,892.00
7.00 43,498.00
13.00 9,516.00
5,225.00 5,225.00
6,000.00 6,000.00
6.50 6,435.00

Total Unit
$84,566.00

Outdoor Enterprise, LLC

Total Unit
Unit Price Price

2.50 17,365.00
11.50 71,461.00
17.50 12,810.00
2,464.00 2,464.00
2,950.00 2,950.00
5.00 4,950.00

Total Unit
$112,000.00

Finfrock Construction Company

Total Unit
Unit Price Price

1.50 10,419.00
8.25 51,265.50
11.50 8,418.00
3,392.50 3,392.50
2,242.50 2,242.50
5.75 5,692.50

Total Unit

___ S81430.00

Total Unit
Unit Price Price

2.00 13,892.00
9.00 55,926.00
13.00 9,516.00
5,225.00 5,225.00
8,000.00 8,000.00
6.50 6,435.00

Total Unit
__ 59899400

Total Unit
Unit Price Price

2.50 17,365.00
12.50 77,675.00
18.50 13,542.00
2,468.00 2,468.00
3,000.00 3,000.00
5.00 4,950.00

Total Unit
$119,000.00



Item

Base Bid
202
608
608
614
624
659

Item
Alt Bid #1

202
608
608
614
624
659

VILLAGE OF POTSDAM, MIAMI COUNTY, OHIO
West Cross Street Sidewalk Improvements

Description

Walk Removed

Concrete Walk, As Per Plan

8" Thick Concrete Walk
Maintaining Traffic

Mobilization

Seeding and Mulching, As Per Plan

Total Base Bid

Description

Walk Removed

Concrete Walk, As Per Plan

8" Thick Concrete Walk
Maintaining Traffic

Mobilization

Seeding and Mulching, As Per Plan

Total Alternate Bid #1

Quantity

6,946
6,214
732

1

1

990

S.F.
S.F.
S.F.
Lump
Lump
SY.

Quantity

6,946
6,214
732

990

S.F.
S.F.
S.F.
Lump
Lump
SY.

Bid Breakdown

Double Jay Construction, Inc

L.J. DeWeese Co. Inc

Unit Price

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

Total Unit

Price

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

Total Unit
$0.00

Double Jay Construction, Inc

Total Unit
Unit Price Price
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid

Total Unit

$0.00

L.J. DeWeese Co. Inc

Unit Price

2.40

9.10
13.00
3,305.00
10,610.20
6.70

Total Unit
Price

16,670.40
56,547.40
9,516.00
3,305.00
10,610.20
6,633.00

Total Unit

$103,282.00

Total Unit
Unit Price Price

3.00 20,838.00
12.00 74,568.00
16.00 11,712.00
4,700.00 4,700.00
3,800.00 3,800.00
2.00 1,980.00

Total Unit

$117,598.00



